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FOI ref no: SCO/FOI/014/2022

Freedom of Information request: reference SCO/FO1/014/2022 first notified to us by email on 1 April 2022.
Staffordshire Commissioner’s Office response to your enquiry is as follows:

| can confirm that the Staffordshire Commissioner’s Office does partially hold the requested information.

1. Whatroad victims supportservices do you offer?
The Staffordshire Commissioner’s Office currently fund Brake on an annual basis to provide the
above service. Brake provides a free support service for those who are bereaved or seriously
injured. They also support someone who is helping a road crash victim.

The Victim Gateway service which is commissioned by the Staffordshire Commissioner’s Office will
also support someone who is a victim of aroad traffic accident where, a criminal offence has been
committed and they are a victim of crime.

2. Who provides your road victims support services?
Brake, a road safety charity.
https://www.brake.org.uk/how-we-help/get-help-if-a-crash-victim

3. Whoiseligible forroad victim support?
https://www.brake.org.uk/how-we-help/get-help-if-a-crash-victim/information-and-advice-after-
road-death-or-serious-injury

4. What number/percentage of road victims receive road victims support?
This information is not held by the Staffordshire Commissioners Office and you may want to
approach Brake directly https://www.brake.org.uk/get-in-touch

5. Whatnumber/percentage of road victims do not take up an offer of road victims support?
This information is not held by the Staffordshire Commissioners Office and you may want to
approach Brake directly https://www.brake.org.uk/get-in-touch

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for aninternal review.
Internal review requests should be submitted within two months of the date of receipt of this email and
should be addressed to:

Compliance Manager

Staffordshire Commissioner’s Office
Block 9, Staffordshire Police HQ
Stafford

ST18 OYY

Or emailed to: FOI.PFCC@ staffordshire-pfcc.pnn.gov. uk.

Please remember to quote the reference number in any future communications.

Yours sincerely
Freedom of Information Decision Maker

Staffordshire Commissioners Office, Ground Floor, Block 9, Weston Road, Stafford ST18 OYY
Twitter: @StaffsPFCC  www.staffordshire-pfcc-gov.uk
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